BID TABULATION 25-446 AGRICULTURAL CHEMICALS
Helena Agri-Enterprises, LLC, Nutrien Solutions, Orion Solutions, LLC SiteOne Landscape Supply,
‘Tampa, Florida Waverly, Florida Rocky Mount, Virginia Cleveland, Ohio
Hem |1 Description U“:::‘“ Proposed L;f‘::s Total Case | Pre-Approved Alternate Brand and ”":‘p:’:‘“ Proposed ”P"::s Total Case | Pre-Approved Alternate Brand and U“:::i“ Proposed L;f‘::s Total Case | Pre-Approved Alternate Brand and ”":‘p:’:‘“ Proposed ”P"::s Total Case. | Pre-Approved Alternate Brand and
# aliqt/ptib) Container Size/Unit| Case Price Product Number sallqtiptib) Container Size/Unit| Case Price Product Number sallqt/puib) Container Size/Unit| Case Price Product Number sallqtiptib) Container Size/Unit| Case Price Product Number
1| Weedar 64 s 2795 250 wl | 2 |S 13975 s 1950 250 2 |s 9750 Platoon s 2305 250/ GAL| s | S 28813 | As-Specified s 31.09] 250 wl| 2 |S 15545 As-Specified
2 _|Rodeo - No Substitute NB NB NB | NB NB NB NB NB NB | NB NB NB NB NB NB | NB NB NB NB NB | NB NB NB
3 |Generic Aquatic Glyphosate (minimum 51%) | § 2950|250 w | o |5 M0 Aquamaster s 22500 250 o |5 e Aquaneat s 2315 asolgan| s |5 20 Qggﬁﬁiﬁﬁﬁiﬁfﬁu s 2948] 250 wl | o |5 M40 Aquamaster
4| Aquathol Granular Super K s 2150|2000 s | 2 [S 86000 s 2150 2000 2 | S 86000 Aquathol Super K S 2150 2000[1B | 40 | S 17.200.00 | As-Specified s 2363 1000 b | 4 |S 94520 As-Specified
5 |Aauathol K Liquid S 8330 250 wl | 2 |S 41650 s 8330 250 2 |$ 41650 Aauathol k S 8330 250/ GAL| 5 | S 1041.25 | As-Specified S 8883  1.00 wl | 4 |S 35532 As-Specified
6| Clearcast - No Substitute s 29939] 100 wml | 2 |S 59878 S 30478] 100 2 |$ 60956 Clearcast $ 29939 100[GAL| 2 | S 59878 | AsSpecified S 34745] 100 wl | 2 |$ 69490 As-Specified
7| Clearcast - No Substitute $ 20500 1500 wl | 1 [S 307500 S 30419] 1500 1|8 456285 Clearcast $ 20881 1500 GAL| 15 |$ 6723225 | AsSpecified NB NB NB | NB NB No Bid
8 | Cutrine Plus/Cutrine FL909 NB NB NB | NB NB NB NB NB NB | NB NB NB s 3551 100/ GAL| 4 [ S 14204 |AsSpecified $ 3800 1.00 wl | 4 |S 15200 Cutrine Plus
9| Cutrine Plus/Cutrine FL909 S 2002 250 wl | 2 |S 14510 s 2750 250 2 |$ 13750 Cutrine FL 909 S 2607 250/ GAL| 5 | S 32588 | As-Specified s 3137|250 wl| 2 |S 15685 Cutrine Plus
10_|D-Limonene 100% - Cidekick s 2702 250 wl | 2 |S 13510 s 2550 250 2 |$  12750| Cidekick 2 availableatalowercost | S 2050 250{GAL| 5 | S 25625 [NOVITA TRACE s - $ - No Bid
11| Defoamer (10% or Greater) - Foambuster S 885 1.0 T s - $ ) S 900 roofor | 1o |5 "% Novima Foamino more S 650  1.00 T LESCO Recede
12_|Galleon - No Substitute s 70712] 100 ot | 1 [S 70712 s 7072|100 6 | S 420072 Galleon S 69462 100[QT | 6 | S 416772 |AsSpecified s - $ - No Bid
13 _|Habitat BASF - No Substitute S 11659] 250 w | o |5 %% S 12500] 250 2 |5 250 iher Imazapyr s available for lowercost | $ 10943 asolean] s |5 M8 A pecified s 11297] 250 wl | o |53 As-Specified
14_|Hydrothol 191 Granular s at0] 2000 b | 2 |S 16400 s ato]l 2000 2 |$ 16400 Hydrothol Gr s 4l 2000[ 1B | 2 [ S 16400 [AsSpecified s 39| 2000 b | 2 [$ 15960 As-Specified
15 |Hydrothol 191 Liquid s 8670] 250 wml | 2 |S 43350 s 8670 250 2 |$ 43350 Hydrothol S 8670 250/ GAL| 5 | S 108375 | As-Specified s - $ - No Bid
16 ﬁﬁmﬁ.fi&ﬁff 1ol (oriD 3660] 250 wl | g |5 000 s 35000 100 o |5 1 Reign LC S 2850 roofoar| 4 |5 "% )\ovima priFr controL s - s ) No Bid
Polymer (30% or Greater) - Non-lonic HVALUE! H#VALUE! s N
| 17 [(Sinking) - PolvAn NB NB NB | NB NB NB NB NB | NB NB s - NB NB NB | NB NB NB
18 |Sonar AS - No Substitute $ 2.01534] 1.0 wl | 4 [S 846136 S 211534] 100 4 | S 846136 Sonar AS $ 2077.94 100/ GAL| 4 | 831176 | AcSpecified S 84999]  1.00 at | 6 [$ 509994 As-Specified
19 |Sonar s - s - Sonar One S 2.000.00 1.00 4 [$ 800000 Avast S - S - s - NoBid
20_|Sonar Genesis s 31133 100 wl | 4 |S 124532 S 31138] 100 1|8 3138 Sonar Genesis S 30587 100/ GAL| 4 | 122348 | AcSpecified S 31138]  1.00 gal | 4 |$ 124552 As-Specified
N 250.00 $ 235.00 N 503.75 $ 221.40
21_|Diquat dibromide - Tribune S 5000 250 wl | 2 s 4700 250 2 Tribune S 4030 250{GAL| 5 ALLIGARE DIQUAT EPA#81927-35 | §  4428] 250 wal | 2 As-Specified
22 |Reward Sygenta - No Substitute s 9600] 250 wml | 2 |S 48000 s 9600 250 2 | 48000 Reward S 9600 250/ GAL| 5 | S 120000 | As-Specified s 9700 250 wl | 2 |$ 48500 As-Specified
23 |Flumioxazin 51% s 3120 500 s | 4 [S 62400 Semera s 36000 500 4 |S 72000 Schooner S 2949 500[1B | 20 | S 2,949.00 | As-Specified s 3360 500 b | 4 |S 67200 As-Specified
24 |Buffer - Buffer PS S 2700|250 gal | 2 |S 13500 s - - $ - s - S 242 1.00 el | 4 |S 89.68 LESCO Conform
S 1.120.00 s 1.550.80 $ 31.200.00 S 8316.60
25| Tradewind - No Substitute s 3500 200 or | 16 Airstream (5x4x2)(07) S 1.55080]  1.00 1 Tradewind S 780,00 s00loz | 5 As-Specified S 166332]  1.00 | s As-Specified
26_|imazapyr - Polaris s 7000] 250 wml | 2 |S 35000 s 63000 250 2 |$ 31500 Polaris or Arsenal S 6049 250/ GAL| 5 | S 756.13 | As-Specified s 8578] 250 wl | 2 |$ 42890 As-Specified
27_|Clipper SC s 347.00]  1.00 bot | 4 | S 138800 64 0z bot s 27500] 100 2 |$ 55000 price per gallon Flumigard SC S 14498 64.00] 0z | 256 FLUMIGARD SC EPA#81927-78 s 439] 6400 oz | 4 |S 112384 SureGuard EZ
28 | Procellacor SC 100 PDU x 2 (200 PDU) $ 490000 100 wit| 2 |S 9800.00 s 4900  1.00 200 | $9:800.00 ProcellaCOR s 4825 200/UNIT| 2 | S 193.00 | As-Specified s - $ - No Bid
29 | Procellacor SC 12 PDU x 6 (72 PDU) 5 58800 100 wit| 6 |$ 352800 s 4900 100 72 |$ 352800 ProcellaCOR s 5200 6.00[UNIT| 6 | S 187200 | As-Specified s - $ - No Bid
30_|F-239 Degreaser S 1774 3000 gal | 1 |S 53220 30 gal $ 1885 1.00 4 |S 75.40 F-239 s - s - s - s - NoBid
31 _|Esplanade EZ S 8918 250 gal | 2 |S 44590 Roundup Quikpro SC Total $ 7900|250 2 [$ 39500 Roundup Quickpro SC total $ - s - S - s - NoBid
32| Esplanade 200 SC S 41536] 100 at | 4 [S 166144 S 41536]  1.00 4 | 166144 Esplanade sc quarts S 41536 100[QT | 4 |S 166144 ]|AsSpecified s - $ - No Bid
33 |Esplanade 200 SC 5 1500.12] 250 wml | 2 S 754560 S 1509.12] 250 2 |$ 754560 Esplanade s $ 1500.12 250/ GAL| 5 | S 18864.00 | As-Specified s - $ - No Bid
34 |Basal Oil (AF) S 1358] 250 wml| 2 [$ 6790 2.5 gal s 1075|1125 1|8 120904 Bark oil red drum S 560 100{GAL| 4 |S 2240 |HYPRENE 40 S 2260 250 wl | 2 |$ 11300 Alligare Basil Oil + Dye
35 _|Basal Oil (Impel Red) s 2727 250 gal | 2 |S 13635 25 gal S - s - S 5.60 1.00[GAL| 4 |S 22.40 |HYPRENE 40 s - s - No Bid
36| Generic Glyphosate s is46| 250 wml| 2 [S 9230 Ranger Pro s 1900 250 2 |S 9500 Makaze S 1530 250/ GAL| 5 | S 191.25 | As-Specified s 1790] 250 wl| 2 |S 8950 LESCO Prosecutor Pro
37 _|Ranger Pro S 18388 250 gl | 2 |S 94.40 s - s - S 1530 250{GAL| 5 |S 19125 | AsSpecified $ 1707 250 el | 2 |S 8585 As-Specified
38 |Garlon 4 Ultra s 9200] 250 wml | 2 |S 46000 S 8200] 250 2 |$ 41000 Element available s 4785 250{GAL| 5 | S 59813 |AsSpecified S 6036 250 wl | 2 |$ 30180 LESCO Tryclopyr 4 Ester
39 |Milestone S 8225 1.00 at | 12 [ S 987.00 $ 8125 1.00 12 S 97500 Milestone S 6625 1.00[OT | 12 | S 795.00 | As-Specified S - s - NoBid
40| Milestone s 32500 250 gl | 2 [S 162500 s 32500] 250 2 |$ 162500 Milestone 5 32500 250/ GAL| 5 | S 406250 | As-Specified S 34668] 250 wl | 2 |$ 173340 As-Specified




	Price Sheet

