BID TABULATION 24-709 AUTO BODY AND PAINT
REPAIR SERVICES
24-709 - BID TABULATION
ABC BUS, INC. 4 gy Cllim & Cecil Clark Chevrolet SUN STATE FORD, INC.
Repair Inc
SHOP LOCATION SHOP LOCATION SHOP LOCATION SHOP LOCATION
17469 West Colonial Drive,|| 25 S Bay St. Eustis, FL 8843 US HWY 441 SEED WIT (COLONKL

Shop Facility Location

Winter Garden FL, 34787

32726

LEESBURG, FL 34788

DRIVE ORLANDO, FL.
32808

Emergency Contact

Isaac Cornell Cell:
352-936-1847
Email: Jcornell@abc-

Ryan DeMarco
ryan@allcountycollision.com
352-357-4599

TODD KENDALL
352-787-6888
COLLISIONCENTER@CECI

MARK W. JOHNSON

companies.com LCLARKCHEVROLET.COM
Located within a 30 miles radius of 20423 Independence Blvd.,
YES YES YES YES
Groveland, FL
H 0,
Labor rate per hour for Equipment Repair (not under warranty) BIRR(D (Eeomiz 16572 $170.00 $50.00
from door rate
Pickup or delivery services offered? YES YES YES YES
Pick up / delivery fee for Equipment per call Cost+ 15% $150 or tow bill if required $100.00 DRIVABLE NO CHARGE

GROUP A - AUTO /SUV / VAN / LIGHT TRUCKS

1A |Labor Rates Rate Per Hour Rate Per Hour Rate Per Hour Rate Per Hour
Body Repair No Bid $58 $60.00 $50.00
Metal Fabricating Welding No Bid $58 $80.00 $50.00
Painting No Bid $58 $60.00 $50.00
Mechanical Repair No Bid $115 $170.00 $200.00
Frame Repair No Bid $95 $80.00 $75.00
| 2A |Materials Rates % Markup on Cost % Markup on Cost % Markup on Cost % Markup on Cost
Paint Materials No Bid Refinishers List Price LIST PRICE $40.00HOUR
Factory / Repair Parts No Bid Manufacturers List Price LIST PRICE $0.00
Body Materials No Bid Manufacturers List Price LIST PRICE $0.00
| 3A |Towing Services Rate Per Mile Rate Per Mile Rate Per Mile Rate Per Mile
No Bid Sublet to Almand's Towing $100 HOOK PLUS $7/MILE $6.50
Regular Hours (8am-5pm)
i 6.50
Emergency / After Hours No Bid $200 HOOK PLUS $7/MILE $
Vehicle Delivery No Bid $100 HOOK PLUS $7/MILE $110.00
4A |Miscellaneous Charges Total Cost Total Cost Total Cost Total Cost
. High variability due to
. No Bid . . 0.00 5.00
Misc. Shop Charges o B! complexity of job $ 8
Environmental Charges No Bid $4.50 Haz Waste $5.00 $3.50
Disposal Fees: No Bid $10 $5.00 $3.00
Any other Fee (List Fees) No Bid
{Enter additional fee} No Bid $115/hr $10.00
{Enter additional fee} No Bid $98.90
{Enter additional fee} No Bid $148.50

GROUP B - MEDIUM / HEAVY TRUCKS, BUSES, AND EQUIPMENT

1B |Labor Rates Rate Per Hour Rate Per Hour Rate Per Hour Rate Per Hour

Body Repair $126.00 $95 $125.00 $80.00
Metal Fabricating Welding $126.00 $115 $125.00 $80.00
Painting $120.00 $95 $125.00 $80.00
Mechanical Repair $126.00 $150 NO BID $200.00
Frame Repair $126.00 $150 $125.00 $80.00

| 2B |Materials Rates % Markup on Cost % Markup on Cost % Markup on Cost % Markup on Cost
Paint Materials 40% Refinishers List Price LIST PRICE $50.00HOUR
Factory / Repair Parts 30% Manufacturers List Price LIST PRICE $0.00
Body Materials 30% Manufacturers List Price LIST PRICE $0.00

| 3B |Towing Services Rate Per Mile Rate Per Mile Rate Per Mile Rate Per Mile
Regular Hours (8am-5pm) $6.08 Sublet to Almand's Towing NO BID $8.50
Emergency / After Hours $6.08 NO BID $8.50
Vehicle Delivery $6.08 NO BID $175.00

| 4B |Miscellaneous Charges Total Cost Total Cost Total Cost Total Cost
Misc. Shop Charges $14/hr $10.00
Environmental Charges Incl. $5.00 $7.00
Disposal Fees: Incl. $5.00 $6.50
Any other Fee (List Fees) Incl.
{Enter additional fee} Incl. $20.00




	Bid Tab

