BID TABULATION 24-708 OIL AND LUBRICANT PRODUCTS

24-708 - Bid Tabulation PetroChoice LLC Lynch Fuel Company Safety-Kleen Systems, Inc.
Emergency Contact Information: | -*/% 5% ’w”:%’;;;"”"“‘” com, 267 Emergency Contact Information: {enter emergency contact info} Emergency Contact Information: 800-645-8265 (EM Call Center)
DESCRIPTION UNIT QUANTITY | UNITPRICE | EXTENDED PRICE [ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT QUANTITY UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE | TTEM DESCRIPTION UNIT QUANTITY | UNITPRICE | EXTENDED PRICE
1 5W-20 Motor Oil 55 Gal. Drum 1 $ mas|s mas| 1 5W-20 Motor Oil 5 Gl 1 53058 s3058| 1 5W-20 Motor Oil 55 Gal. Drum 1 $ 49500 | 5 495.00
MEDALLION PLUS MED10000004662 SP/GF-64 Quaker State Syn Bid 5w20 550024134 st Perforamnce Plus 3103300 See dttatched
2 5W-20 Motor Ol Quarts | 12 $ 1.61 | $ v 2 5W-20 Motor Oil Quarts | 2 $ s0.00| 2 5W-20 Motor Oil Quarts | 12 $ 3400 | $ 408.00
MEDALLION PLUS MED10000015086 SP/GF-64 Pennzoil 520 550035002 R 3103296 one case
3 5W-30 Motor Oil 55 Gal. Drum | 1 $ 325 | $ mas| 3 5W-30 Motor Oil 55 Gl | 1 $ s30s8| 3 SW-30 Motor Ol 55 Gal. Drum 1 $ 468.00 | $ 468.00
MEDALLION PLUS MED10000004660 SP/GF-64 Quaker State Syn Bid 5w30 550024136 Perforamnce Plus 3103306 See dttatched
4 5W-30 Motor Ol Quarts | 12 $ 232 | $ 84| 4 5W-30 Motor Oil Quarts | 2 $ - 4 5W-30 Motor Ol Quarts | 12 $ 42636
MEDALLION PLUS MEDI0000015087 SP/GF-64 Quaker State Syn Bid 5w30 550035091 Perforamnce Plus 3103302 120TX1 Case
5 5W-30 Motor Ol Gal/Bulk | 1 $ 494 | $ 494 s 5W-30 Motor Oil Gal/Bulk | 1 $ 906 s 5W-30 Motor Oil Gal/Bulk | 1 $ 8.45 | $ 8.45
MEDALLION PLUS MED10000004659 SP/GF-64 Quaker State Syn Bid 5w30 500005 Perforamnce Plus 3103350 See dttatched
6 10W-30 Motor Oil 55 Gal. Drum | 1 $ 41273 | $ | 6 I0W-30 Motor Oil 55 Gl | 1 $ - 6 10W-30 Motor Oil 55 Gal. Drum 1 $ 498.79 | $ 498.79
MEDALLION PLUS MED10000004672 SP/GF-64 Perforamnce Plus 3103312 See dttatched
7 10W-30 Motor Oil Quarts | 12 $ 260 | $ 28| 7 I0W-30 Motor Oil Quarts | 12 $ s0.00| 7 10W-30 Motor Oil Quarts | 12 $ 38.20 | $ 458.40
MEDALLION PLUS MEDI0000015085 SP/GF-64 Pennzoil 10w30 550035052 Perforamnce Plus 3103308 120TX1 Case
8 5W-40 Synthetic M/O 55 Gal. Drum | 6 $ 87337 | $ 524022 8 | 5W-40 Synthetic MIO 5 Gl | 6 $ 639582 8 5W-40 Synthetic M/O 55 Gal. Drum 6 No Bid | #VALUE!
DYNAPLEX DYNI0000008152 CK-4 Rotella T6 5w40 550046219 Perforamnce Plus {Enter Catalog/SKU#) See dttatched
9 5W-40 Synthetic M/O Gal. Jugs | 6 $ 12090 [ 9 | 5W-40SyntheticMI0 | Gal Jugs | 6 $ 61.70| 9 5W-40 Synthetic M/O Gal. Jugs 6 No Bid | #VALUE!
DYNAPLEX DYN10000013114 K4 Rotella T6 5wd0 550045347 K4 Perforamnce Plus {Enter Catalog/SKU#} See dttatched
10 HD SAE 30 Motor Oil 55 Gal. Drum | 6 $ 49232 | $ 295392 | 10 [ HD SAE 30 Motor 0il 55 Gl | 6 $ 690.17 | $ 41402 10 HD SAE 30 Motor Oil 55 Gal. Drum 6 No Bid | #VALUE!
DYNAPLEX DYNI0000004704 CF/CF2 Rotella TI 0l 30 550054447 CF-2,CFSL Perforamnce Plus {Enter Catalog/SKU#) See dttatched
1 HD SAE 30 Motor Oil Gal. Jugs | 5 NO BID | H#VALUE! 11 | HDSAE30Motor Oil | Gal Jugs | 5 20.18 | $ 10090 11 HD SAE 30 Motor Oil Gal. Jugs 5 No Bid | #VALUE!
{Enter Manufacturer/Brandy {Enter Catalog/SKU#} {Enter AP Service Code} Rotella TI 0l 30 550054449 CF2,CFSL Perforamnce Plus {Enter Catalog/SKU#} See dttatched
12 HD SAE 40 Motor Oil 55 Gal. Drum | 6 $ 489.22 | $ 203532 12 | HD SAE 40 Motor 0il 55 Gl | 6 $ o HD SAE 40 Motor Oil 55 Gal. Drum 6 No Bid | #VALUE!
DYNAPLEX DYN10000004707 CF/CF.2 Rotella 1 0il 40 550054464 Perforamnce Plus {Enter Catalog/SKU#} See dttatched
13 HD SAE 40 Motor Oil Gal. Jugs | 5 NO BID | H#VALUE! 13 | HDSAE 40 Motor Oil al. Jugs | 5 $ Nt HD SAE 40 Motor Oil Gal. Jugs 5 No Bid | #VALUE!
{Enter Manufacturer/Brand) {Enter Catalog/SKU#} {Enter AP Service Code} Rotella 1 0il 40 550054466 Perforamnce Plus {Enter Catalog/SKU#} See dttatched
14 15W-40 Motor Oil Quarts | 36 $ 499 | $ 17964 | 14 ISW-40 Motor Oil Quarts | 36 $ o 15W-40 Motor Oil Quarts 36 No Bid | #VALUE!
MOBIL DELVAC 1300 SUPER YoMi22454 ol M/T;:f:/:) frotecten 550049483 Perforamnce Plus {Enter Catalog/SKU#} See dttatched
15 15W-40 Motor Oil Gal. Jugs | 12 $ an | 1s ISW-40 Motor Oil Gal. Jugs | 2 $ o 15W-40 Motor Oil Gal. Jugs 12 $ 46.00 | $ 552.00
DYNAPLEX DEZOL DYNI0000002056 RRetllo JT;:{’: " Loy 550045126 Perforamnce Plus 3102238 4X1 gal case
16 15W-40 Motor Oil 55 Gal. Drum | 6 $ 306036 | 16 ISW-40 Motor Oil 55 Gl | 6 N TS 15W-40 Motor Oil 55 Gal. Drum 6 $ 569.72 | $ 3418.32
DYNAPLEX DEZOL DYNI0000004711 Shell T2 15w40 500010130D Perforamnce Plus 3102256 See dttatched
1”7 15W-40 Motor Oil Gal/Bulk | 2000 $ 1510000 | 17 1SW-40 Motor Oil Gal/Bulk | 2000 $ o 15W-40 Motor Oil Gal/Bulk | 2000 $ 9.70 | $ 19,400.00
DYNAPLEX DEZOL DYN10000004710 Shell T2 15w40 500010130 Perforamnce Plus 3102134 See dttatched
18 Non-Detergent SAF, 30 Quarts | 36 NO BID | H#VALUE! 18 | NonDetergentSAE30 | Quarts | 36 $ s Non-Detergent SAE, 30 Quarts 36 No Bid | #VALUE!
{Enter Manufacturer/Brandy {Enter Catalog/SKU#) {Enter AP Service Code} SuperSND30 sus41 Perforamnce Plus {Enter Catalog/SKU#} See dttatched
19 Dexron®I/Mercon® ATF Quarts | 144 $ 228 | $ 32832 | 19 | Dexron®I/Mercon® ATF | Quarts | 144 5 o Dexron®Il/Mercon® ATF Quarts 144 $ 30.13 | $ 563472
Mj(";ﬁf;ggy ’:)Ls %5 MED10000015079 N/A Pennzoil ATF 550050745 Dexlll/Mercon Perforamnce Plus 3101087 120TX I Case




BID TABULATION 24708 OIL AND LUBRICANT PRODUCTS
DESCRIPTION UNIT QUANTITY | UNITPRICE | EXTENDED PRICE [ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT QUANTITY UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT QUANTITY | UNITPRICE | EXTENDED PRICE
20 Dexron®ITl/Mercon® ATF 55 Gal. Drum 6 $ 47601 | s 285606 [ 20 | Desron@iMereonw aTE | 5 G2 6 $ 1,067.86| S o2 Dexron®IT/Mercon® ATF | 55 Gal. Drum 6 $ 51850 | § 3,111.00
Mj(";ﬁf;ggy ’:)Ls %5 MED10000004752 N/A Pennzoil ATF 550050741 Dexlll/Mercon Perforamnce Plus 3101091 See Attatched
21 Dexron® VI Trans. Fluid Quarts 12 $ $ 4140 | 21 | Dexron® VI Trans. Fluid | Quarts | 12 $ 75| s o Dexron® VI Trans. Fluid Quarts 12 No Bid H#VALUE!
Pennzoil Platinum LV MV TEnter {Enter API
MEDALLION PLUS FS GLOBAL MV | MED10000015030 N tain 550041916 Perforamnce Plus Catalog/SKU# e
P! Mercon® V Trans. Fluid Quarts 12 $ 624| s 7488 | 22 | Mercon® v Trans. Fluia | Quarts | 12 $ s o2 Mercon® V Trans. Fluid Quarts 12 No Bid H#VALUE!
VALVOLINE VAL822345 N4 (RamllIA ’ ‘,”T’ e wy sy 550041916 LMy Perforamnce Plus {Enter Catalog/SKUH) {Enter API Service Code}
23 Synthetic Trans. Fluid 55 Gal. Drum | 1 §  1,08457 | $ 108457 | 23 | Synthetic Trans. Fluid 5;:;":"’ | 1 $ 1.815.86 | 5 N S Synthetic Trans. Fluid 55 Gal. Drum 1 $ 846.95 | $ 846.95
DYNAPLEX SYNZOL HD ATF DYNI10000004872 N Shell Spirax S6 ATF AG68 550062005 TES668 Perforamnce Plus 3101874 See Attatched
2 Synthetic Trans. Fluid 5 Gal. Pail | 10 $ 98.60 | $ 98600 [ 24 | synthetic Trans. Fruia | 5 Gal. Pail | 10 185.12 | s N Synthetic Trans. Fluid 5 Gal, Pail 10 No Bid | VAL
DYNAPLEX SYNZOL HD ATF DYNI0000004873 N Shell Spirax S6 ATF A668 550062007 TES668 Perforamnce Plus {Enter Catalog/SKUH} See Attatched
25 85W-140 Gear Lube 120 Ib. Keg | 2 $ 200.29 | $ 40058 | 25 | 85W-140 Gear Lube | 120 b, Keg | 2 $ 342.66| $ o8s32| 25 85W-140 Gear Lube 120 1b. Keg 2 No Bid | H#VALUE!
DYNAPLEX RIGEL DYNI10000004809 GL-5 Shell Spirax S4 AX 85wl40 550043593 GL-4,GL-5 M- Perforamnce Plus {Enter Catalog/SKUH} See Attatched
26 85W-140 Gear Lube 55 Gal. Drum | 1 $ 715.00 | $ 2% 85W-140 Gear Lube 5 Gal. | 1 $ 998.49 | 998.49| 26 85W-140 Gear Lube 55 Gal. Drum 1 $ 863.00 | $ 863.00
DYNAPLEX RIGEL DYNI10000004806 GL-5 Shell Spirax S4 85wi40 550043592 GL-4,GL-5 M- Perforamnce Plus 3101776 See Attatched
27 80W-90 Gear Lube 35 Ib. Pail | 2 $ 86.76 | $ ms2| 27 80W-90 Gear Lube 351b.Pail | 2 $ 113.00 | $ 2600 27 80W-90 Gear Lube 35 Ib. Pail | 2 $ 73.00 | $ 146.00
DYNAPLEX GALAXY DYNI10000004814 GL-5 Shell Spirax $4 80w90 550043587 GI-4,GL-5,MT-] Perforamnce Plus 3101865 See Attatched
28 80W-90 Gear Lube 120 Ib. Keg | 1 $ w02 | 28 S0W-90 Gear Lube | 120 Ib. Keg | 1 $ 360.13 | 36003 28 80W-90 Gear Lube 120 Ib. Keg 1 No bid | VAL
DYNAPLEX GALAXY DYNI0000004818 Shell Spirax $4 80w90 550043589 GL4,GL-5MT-1 Perforamnce Plus {Enter Catalog/SKUH} See Attatched
29 Univ. Tractor Hydraulic 55 Gal. Drum | 3 $ 136518 | 29 | Univ. Tractor Hydraulic "grﬁ:"‘ | 3 739.82 | 221946| 29 Univ. Tractor Hydraulic | 55 Gal. Drum 3 $ 525.00 | $ 1,575.00
DYNAPLEX TRAC GARD DYNI0000015507 Shell Spirax $4 TXM 550045338 GL4 Perforamnce Plus 3101483 See Attatched
30 Univ. Tractor Hydraulic Gal/Bulk | 500 $ 383500 | 30 | Univ. Tractor Hydraulic | Gal/Bulk | 500 $ 11.63 | ] 5815.00| 30 Univ. Tractor Hydraulic Gal/Bulk | 500 $ 9.60 | $ 4,800.00
DYNAPLEX TRAC GARD DYNI0000015506 Shell Spirax $4 TXM 500005703 GL4 Perforamnce Plus 3100051 See Attatched
31 Univ. Tractor Hydraulic 5 Gal. Pail | 1 $ 4238 31 | Univ. Tractor Hydraulic | 5 Gal. Pail | 1 $ ns.osl $ 1606 31 Univ. Tractor Hydraulic 5Gal, Pail 1 $ 47.00 | $ 47.00
DYNAPLEX TRAC GARD DYNI10000005854 Shell Spirax $4 TXM 550026891 GL4 Perforamnce Plus 3102162 See Attatched
32 AW-68 Hydraulic Fluid Gal/Bulk | 500 $ 2,675.00 | 32 | AW-68 Hydraulic Fluid | Gal/Bulk | 500 $ s.ml $ 400000 32 AW-68 Hydraulic Fluid Gal/Bulk | 500 $ 8.2 | $ 4,060.00
DYNAPLEX HYDRA 1000 DYNI0000004943 Shell Hydraulic S2 68 500011177 ASTM D943 IS 3448.68 Perforamnce Plus 3100032 See Attatched
3 AW-68 Hydraulic Fluid 55 Gal. Drum | 1 $ soran| 33 | Awees ydraic pia | G | 1 $ 3 AW-68 Hydraulic Fluid | 55 Gal. Drum 1 $ 465.00 | $ 465.00
DYNAPLEX HYDRA 1000 DYNI0000004944 Shell Hydraulic 52 68 55003 ASTM D943 150 3448.68 Perforamnce Plus 3101481 See Attatched
3 AW-68 Hydraulic Fluid 5 Gal. Pail | 1 $ 4128 | 34 | AW-68 Hydraulic Fluid | 5 Gal. Pail | 1 ss.snl $ sss0| 34 AW-68 Hydraulic Fluid 5 Gal, Pail 1 $ 4495 | $ 44.95
DYNAPLEX HYDRA 1000 DYNI0000004946 Shell Hydraulic 52 68 550052556 ASTM D943 150 3448.68 Perforamnce Plus 3101986 See Attatched
35 AW-32 Hydraulic Fluid 5 Gal. Pail | 1 $ 3774 35 | AW-32 Hydraulic Fluid | 5 Gal. Pail | 1 $ 104.06| $ 10406 35 AW-32 Hydraulic Fluid 5Gal, Pail 1 No Bid | #VALUE!
DYNAPLEX HYDRA 1000 DYNI0000004937 Shell Tellus $2 MX 32 550045425 ASTM D943 150 3448.32 Perforamnce Plus {Enter Catalog/SKUH) See Attatched
36 Multipurpose Grease 120 Ib. Keg | 3 $ 133839 [ 36 [  Multipurpose Grease | 120 1b. Keg | 3 $ 56433 | $ 1,60299| 36 Multipurpose Grease 120 1b. Keg 3 460,12 | H#VALUE!
DYNAPLEX ULTRA BLUE DYNI10000002148 Shell Gadus 53 2202 550026854 NLGI2 Perforamnce Plus 3102183 See Attatched
3 Multipurpose Grease 35 Ib. Pail | 1 $ 12607 | 37 | Multipurpose Grease | 351b. Pail | 1 $ zaz.ool $ 20200 37 Multipurpose Grease 35 1b. Pail | 1 $ 13401 | $ 13401
DYNAPLEX ULTRA BLUE DYNI0000002145 Shell Gadus 53 2202 550026853 NLGI2 Perforamnce Plus 3102184 See Attatched
38 Multipurpose Grease 140z Tube | 500 $ 191500 [ 38 |  Multipurpose Grease | 140z Tube | 500 $ 4.80| 5 240000 38 Multipurpose Grease 1402 Tube 500 5 4445 | 5 22,225.00
DYNAPLEX ULTRA BLUE DYNI0000002149 Shell Gadus SI V220C2 550027558 NLGI2 Perforamnce Plus 3102211 10 tube carton
3 3% Moly Grease 140z Tube | 100 $ 459000 | 39 3% Moiy Grease 140z Tube | 100 530 | $ 53000 39 3% Moly Grease 140z Tube 100 No Bid | H#VALUE!
DYNAPLEX 500+ MOLY HT DYNI10000002113 Shell Gadus SI V460d 2 550027657 NLGI2 Perforamnce Plus {Enter Catalog/SKUH} See Attatched




BID TABULATION 24708 OIL AND LUBRICANT PRODUCTS
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT QUANTITY | UNITPRICE | EXTENDED PRICE [ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT QUANTITY UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE | ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT QUANTITY | UNITPRICE | EXTENDED PRICE
n TO-4 Fluid 5 Gal. Pail 2 $ 5025 | s 10050 | 40 TO-4 Fluid 5 Gal. Pail 2 18.45| s 23690| 40 TO-4 Fluid 5 Gal. Pail 2 $ 5978 | s 11956
DYNAPLEX T0-4 30 DYNI10000004769 Shell Spirax $4 CX 50 550026896 SAEJ300 T04 Perforamnce Plus 3102417 See Attatched
4 TO-4 Fluid 55 Gal. Drum | 1 5 55275 | 41 TO-4 Fluid 5;:;":"’ | 1 1,162.44 | Li6244| 41 TO-4 Fluid 55 Gal. Drum 1 5 642.74 | s 642.74
DYNAPLEX T0-4 30 DYNI10000004744 Shell Spirax $4 CX 50 550026907 SAEJ300 T04 Perforamnce Plus 3102419 See Attatched
2 2-Cyele TCW-3 Mix Quarts | 2 $ 15840 [ 42 2.Cycle TCW-3 Mix Quarts | 2 583 | $ 92| 4 2-Cyele TCW-3 Mix Quarts 2 No Bid | #VALUE!
VALVOLINE MP 2 CYCLE TC-W3 VAL822384 Shell Nautilus 550045939 NMMA T3 R s {Enter Catalog/SKUH} See Attatched
r Synthetic Compressor Oil 5 Gal. Pail | 1 $ 138,65 | 43 | Synthetic Compressor Oil [ 5 Gal. Pail | 1 216.00 | $ 21600 43 Synthetic Compressor Oil | 5 Gal. Pail 1 No Bid | H#VALUE!
DYNAPLEX SYNZOL CO ISO 46 DYNI10000004914 Shell Corina R46 550026755 JSO VG 3268 Perforamnce Plus {Enter Catalog/SKU#} See Attatched
m Therma Oil 55 Gal. Drum | 1 $ EYEREY Therma Oil 55 Gl | 1 640.00 | $ 6000 44 Therma Oil 55 Gal. Drum 1 No Bid | #VALUE!
DYNAPLEX ALCOR 628 HTO ISO 68 DYNI10000004681 N/A Shell Heat Transfer 550026755 JSO 6743-12 Perforamnce Plus {Enter Catalog/SKU#} See Attatched
4 Mineral Oil 55 Gal. Drum | 1 $ 98072 | 45 Mineral Oil 5 Gl | 1 880.00 | $ 880.00| 45 Mineral Oil 55 Gal. Drum 1 No Bid | #VALUE!
JAX WHITE MINERAL OIL JAXIWMOGS5S Aeroshell 10 550050799 SAEJ-1966 Perforamnce Plus {Enter Catalog/SKUH} See Attatched
46 Bar & Chain Oil Gal. Jugs | 6 NO BID | H#VALUE! 46 Bar & Chain Oil Gal. Jugs | 6 10.00 | $ 6000 46 Bar & Chain Oil Gal. Jugs 6 No Bid | #VALUE!
{Enter Manufacturer/Brand) {Enter Catalog/SKU#) {Enter API Service Code} Bar Chain Oil R s {Enter Catalog/SKUH} See Attatched
r Kerosene Gal/Bulk | 100 NO BID | #VALUE! i Kerosene 100 4.|n| $ a000| 47 Kerosene Gal/Bulk 100 No Bid | #VALUE!
{Enter Manufacturer/Brand {Enter Catalog/SKU#) {Enter API Service Code} interstate Chemical 200 R s {Enter Catalog/SKUH} See Attatched
4 Wheel Bearing Grease 11b. Tube | 12 $ 348 | 4176 | 48 | Wheel Bearing Grease | 11b. Tube | 12 4.sn| $ s760| 48 Wheel Bearing Grease 11b. Tube P No Bid | H#VALUE!
DYNAPLf\)y(CZ[sTE/;L(‘)I;E/Dw(wMES 2INI0000003 28 N/A Gadus SJ V220 NLGJ2 e {Enter Catalog/SKU#} See Attatched
n Mineral Spirits 5 Gal. Pail | 10 $ 66.14 | 66140 [ 49 Mineral Spirits 60.00 | $ 60000 49 Mineral Spirits 5 Gal. Pail 10 No Bid | HVALU
CALUMET CHMMSP N4 interstate Chemical 9927 Rt {Enter Catalog/SKUH} See Attatched
50 Antifreeze, Heavy Duty 55 Gal. Drum | 1 $ 393.05 | $ 39305 | 50 [ Anifvecre, HeavyDuy [ S0 | 1 4zs.nn| $ a500| s0 Antifreeze, Heavy Duty | 55 Gal. Drum 1 No Bid | #VALUE!
23kt f,i’)fzﬁ_ I\L’,’;gf# i KOS10287 NA e 940100055 ASTM D3306 Perforamnce Plus {Enter Catalog/SKUH See Attatched
51 Antifrecze, ELC 50/50 55 Gal. Drum | 1 $ 30488 | ] 0488 | st [ antifreese, LSS0 [ 35O | 1 499.00' $ 49900 51 Antifreeze, ELC 50/50 55 Gal. Drum 1 $ 365.00 | $ 365.00
DEFENDAL GLOBAL HD K0S10291 N4 Shell Rotella ELC 50/50 550022522 ASTM D3306 D6210 Perforamnce Plus 640057 See Attatched
52 Antifreeze, ELC 50/50 Gal./Jugs | 20 NO BID | #VALUE! 52 | Antifrecse, ELC50/50 | Gal/dugs | 20 8.59 | | 52 Antifreeze, ELC 50/50 Gal/Jugs | 20 No Bid | #VALUE!
{Enter Manufacturer/Brand {Enter Catalog/SKU#) {Enter API Service Code} Shell Rotella ELC 50/50 94042 ASTM D3306 D6210 Rt s {Enter Catalog/SKUH} See Attatched
53 5W-20 Syn. Blend M/O 55 Gal. Drum | 1 $ 37125 | anas| s [ swaosymienawio [ 6 | 1 53058 | $ s3058| 3 5W-20 Syn. Blend M/O | 55 Gal. Drum 1 $ 459.00 | $ 459.00
MEDALLION PLUS MEDI0000004662 SPIGF-64 Quaker State Sy Bid 5w20 550024134 st Perforamnce Plus 3103300 See Attatched
54 5W-20 Syn. Blend M/O Quarts | 12 $ 159 | $ 1908 | 54 | sw-20Syn.Blend M0 | Quarts | 12 5 . | $ - 4 5W-20 Syn. Blend M/O Quarts | 12 $ 3400 | $ 408.00
MEDALLION PLUS MEDI0000015086 SPIGF-64 Perforamnce Plus 3103296 120TX1 Case
55 5W-30 Syn. Blend M/O 55 Gal. Drum | 1 $ 37125 | $ anas| s [ swavsynienaso 350 | 1 53058 | $ s3058| 55 SW-30 Syn. Blend M/O | 55 Gal. Drum 1 $ 468.00 | $ 468.00
MEDALLION PLUS MEDI0000004660 SPIGF-64 Quaker State Syn Bid 5w30 550024136 st Perforamnce Plus 3103306 See Attatched
56 SW-30 Syn. M/O Quarts | 12 $ 227 | 2724 56 5W-30 Syn. MIO Quarts | 12 s - | $ . 56 SW-30 Syn. M/O Quarts | 12 $ 3553 | $ 42636
MEDALLION PLUS MED10000015087 SPIGF-64 Perforamnce Plus 3103302 127X 1 Case
57 10W-30 Blend M/O 55 Gal. Drum | 1 $ 40782 | $ aw782| 57 T0W-30 Blend MIO 55 Gl | 1 s . | s A|os 10W-30 Blend M/O 55 Gal. Drum 1 $ 542,66 | $ 542.66
MEDALLION PLUS MEDI0000004672 SPIGF-64 Perforamnce Plus 3103312 See Attatched
s8 10W-30 Blend M/O Quarts | 12 $ 263 | $ 3156 | 58 JOW-30 Blend MIO Quarts | 12 $ - | s A oss 10W-30 Blend M/O Quarts | 12 $ 3745 | $ 449.40
MEDALLION PLUS MEDI0000015085 SPIGF-64 Pennzzoil 10w30 550035052 v Perforamnce Plus 3103308 124t X1 Case
59 5W-30 Synthetic M/O Quarts | 12 $ 410 | $ 4920 59 | 5W-30 Synthetic Mr0 Quarts | 12 $ - | s o 5W-30 Synthetic M/O Quarts | 12 $ 4029 | $ 48348
MEDALLION PLUS MEDI10000008956 SPIGF-64 Perforamnce Plus 3103321 12¢tX 1 Case




BID TABULATION 24-708 OIL AND LUBRICANT PRODUCTS
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT QUANTITY UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE |ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT QUANTITY UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT QUANTITY UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE
60 5W-30 Synthetic M/O 55 Gal. Drum 1 $ 52216 | § 52216 | 60 5W-30 Synthetic MO ;rc.:, 1 $ 530.58| $ 530.58| 60 5W-30 Synthetic M/O 55 Gal. Drum 1 660.39 | $ 660.39
MEDALLION PLUS MEDI10000014487 SP/GF-64 Quaker State Syn Bid 5w30 550024136 SL Perforamnce Plus 3103323
61 5W-30 M/O Bulk Gallons | 500 $ 1L.61 | $ 580500 | 61 SW-30 MIO Bulk Gallons | 500 $ 9.ns| ] 61 5W-30 M/O Bulk Gallons | 500 1045 | $ 5.225.00
MEDALLION PLUS MEDI10000014486 SP/GF-64 Quaker State Syn Bid 5w30 500005522 SL Perforamnce Plus 3103358 See Attatched
62 15W-40 Synthetic M/O Quarts | 12 $ 4.92 | $ 59.04 62 15W-40 Synthetic MIO Quarts | 12 $ - | S - 62 15W-40 Synthetic M/O Quarts 12 No Bid | #VALUE!
VL ”({;L;;’g g ﬁ §’7 EG j;’LJ ZZUN - VALS91007 CK-4 Perforamnce Plus {Enter Catalog/SKUH; See Attatched
63 15W-40 Synthetic M/O 55 Gal. Drum | 1 $ 960.49 | 960.49 63 15W-40 Synthetic MO 5;::;:\" | 1 $ - | S - 63 15W-40 Synthetic M/O 55 Gal. Drum 1 No Bid | #VALUE!
VALVOLINE PB ONE SOLUTION VAL891011 CK-4 Perforamnce Plus {Enter Catalog/SKU#} See Attatched
64 15W-40 Synthetic M/O 55 Gal. Drum | 1 $ 960.49 | 960.49 64 15W-40 Synthetic MIO Ssr(::‘L | 1 $ - | S - 64 15W-40 Synthetic M/O 55 Gal. Drum 1 No Bid | #VALU
VALVOLINE PB ONE SOLUTION VAL891011 Perforamnce Plus {Enter Catalog/SKU#} See Attatched
65 | Transynd (Allison) Transmission | 55 Gal. Drum | 1 $ 108457 108457 | 65 T';‘“»‘““ (Allison) 5;::":"’ | 1 s 1,815.16 | s 1815.16| 65 | Transynd (Allison) Transmission | 55 Gal. Drum 1 1,157.00 | s 1,157.00
DYNAPLEX SYNZOL HD ATF DYN10000004872 N/A Shell Spirax S6 ATF A668 550062005 TES668 Perforamnce Plus 3102413 See Attatched
66 Diesel Exhaust Fluid Bulk Gal./Bulk | 500 $ 127 | $ 635.00 66 Diesel Exhaust Fluid Bulk Gal./Bulk | 500 $ 6| S 1,280.00 66 Diesel Exhaust Fluid Bulk Gal./Bulk | 500 243 | $ 1,215.00
MUSKET DYNDEFBULK N/A Blue Sky 87305 1S0 22241 Perforamnce Plus DEF030 See Attatched
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