
 23-760 BID TABULATION  23-760 MOSQUITO MANAGEMENT 
INSECTICIDE CHEMICALS

ITEM # ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE PER 
UNIT

EXTENDED PRICE 
(X CONTAINER SIZE)

UNIT PRICE PER 
UNIT

EXTENDED PRICE 
(X CONTAINER SIZE)

UNIT PRICE PER 
UNIT

EXTENDED PRICE 
(X CONTAINER SIZE)

UNIT PRICE PER 
UNIT

EXTENDED PRICE 
(X CONTAINER SIZE)

UNIT PRICE PER 
UNIT

EXTENDED PRICE 
(X CONTAINER SIZE)

1 ALTOSID XR EXTENDED RESIDUAL 
BRIQUETS BOX No Bid - See 

alternate BOX $3.72 $818.40 BOX $818.40 $4,092.00 BOX No bid BOX $818.40/case $818.40/case of 220

2 ALTOSID S-R-20 5 2X2.5 GL CASE No Bid 5 2X2.5 GL CASE $1,017.70 $5,088.50 5 2X2.5 GL CASE $5,088.50 $25,442.50 5 2X2.5 GL CASE No bid 5 2X2.5 GL CASE $5,088.50/case $5,088.50/case of 2x2.5 
gal

3 AQUABAC XT (2X2.5 GL CASE) 2X2.5 GL CASE No Bid 2X2.5 GL CASE NO BID NO BID 2X2.5 GL CASE $180.00 $900.00 2X2.5 GL CASE No bid 2X2.5 GL CASE See alternate 
brands See alternate brands

4 AQUABAC XT (30 GL DRUM) 30 GL DRUM No Bid 30 GL DRUM NO BID NO BID 30 GL DRUM $1,069.80 $5,349.00 30 GL DRUM No bid 30 GL DRUM See alternate 
brands See alternate brands

5 BVA2 LARVICIDE OIL 5 GL PAIL $19.99/gal $99.95/pail 5 GL PAIL NO BID NO BID 5 GL PAIL 5 GL PAIL No bid 5 GL PAIL $89.25/pail $89.25 / 5 gallon pail

6 BIOMIST 31+66 - PERMANONE 
ALTERNATE 30 GL DRUM No Bid - See 

alternate 30 GL DRUM NO BID NO BID 30 GL DRUM 30 GL DRUM No bid 30 GL DRUM See item 23 
below See item 23 below

7 BIOMIST 31+66 - PERMANONE 
ALTERNATE 275 GL TOTE No Bid - See 

alternate 275 GL TOTE NO BID NO BID 275 GL TOTE 275 GL TOTE No bid 275 GL TOTE See item 24 
below See item 24 below

8 COCO BEAR 5 2X2.5 GL CASE No Bid 5 2X2.5 GL CASE $54.08 $270.40 5 2X2.5 GL CASE 5 2X2.5 GL CASE No bid 5 2X2.5 GL CASE NO BID NO BID

9 DELTAGUARD ULV (2X2.5 GL CASE) 5 2X2.5 GL CASE No Bid 5 2X2.5 GL CASE NO BID NO BID 5 2X2.5 GL CASE 5 2X2.5 GL CASE No bid 5 2X2.5 GL CASE $1,275.00 / case $1,275.00 / 5 gal case

10 DELTAGUARD ULV (30 GL DRUM) 30 GL DRUM No Bid 30 GL DRUM NO BID NO BID 30 GL DRUM 30 GL DRUM No bid 30 GL DRUM $7,470.00 / 
drum

$7,470.00 / 30 gal 
drum

11 DELTAGUARD ULV (250 GL TOTE) 250 GL TOTE No Bid 250 GL TOTE NO BID NO BID 250 GL TOTE 250 GL TOTE No bid 250 GL TOTE $61,500.00 / tote $61,500.00 / 250 gal 
tote

12 FOURSTAR CRG (35 LB BAG) 35 LB BAG No Bid 35 LB BAG $17.59 $615.65 35 LB BAG 35 LB BAG No bid 35 LB BAG NO BID NO BID

13 FOURSTAR CRG BTI (35 LB BAG) 35 LB BAG No Bid 35 LB BAG $13.92 $487.20 35 LB BAG 35 LB BAG No bid 35 LB BAG NO BID NO BID

14 FYFANON (5 GL PAIL) 5 gal pail $92.12/gl $460.60/pail 5 gal pail NO BID NO BID 5 gal pail $74.51 $372.55 5 gal pail No bid  5 gal pail NO BID NO BID

15 FYFANON (55 GL DRUM) 55 gal drum $87.70/gl $4,823.50/drum 55 gal drum NO BID NO BID 55 gal drum $4,060.10 $20,300.50 55 gal drum No bid  55 gal drum NO BID NO BID

16 FYFANON (260 GL TOTE) 260 GL TOTE $84.97/gl $22,092.20/tote 260 GL TOTE NO BID NO BID 260 GL TOTE $19,019.00 $95,095.00 260 GL TOTE No bid 260 GL TOTE NO BID NO BID

17 FYFANON (BULK PRICE PER GALLON) 1 GL No Bid  1 GL NO BID NO BID 1 GL $70.00 $70,000.00 1 GL No bid  1 GL NO BID NO BID

18 FYFANON EW 5 2X2.5 GL PAIL $74.32/gl $371.60/pail 5 2X2.5 GL PAIL NO BID NO BID 5 2X2.5 GL PAIL 5 2X2.5 GL PAIL No bid 5 2X2.5 GL PAIL NO BID NO BID

19 FYFANON EW 30 GL $70.32/gl $2,109.60/drum 30 GL NO BID NO BID 30 GL  30 GL No bid  30 GL NO BID NO BID

20 MOSKITO CARE CASE $149.00/cs $149.00/cs  12x4oz 
case CASE NO BID NO BID CASE CASE No bid CASE NO BID NO BID

21 NATULAR G30 (GRANULAR) 40 LB BAG No Bid 40 LB BAG $20.40 $816.00 40 LB BAG 40 LB BAG No bid 40 LB BAG NO BID NO BID

22 NATULAR 2EC (LIQUID) 5 GL CASE – 2X2.5 No Bid 5 GL CASE – 2X2.5 $1,688.71 $8,443.55 5 GL CASE – 2X2.5 5 GL CASE – 2X2.5 No bid 5 GL CASE – 2X2.5 NO BID NO BID

23 PERMANONE 31-66 (30 GL DRUM) 30 GL DRUM No Bid - See 
alternate  30 GL DRUM NO BID NO BID 30 GL DRUM  30 GL DRUM No bid  30 GL DRUM $3,540.00/drum $3,540.00 / 30 gal 

drum

24 PERMANONE 31-66 (275 GL TOTE) 275 GL TOTE No Bid - See 
alternate 275 GL TOTE NO BID NO BID 275 GL TOTE 275 GL TOTE No bid 275 GL TOTE $32,450.00/tote $32,450.00 / 275 gal 

tote

25 SUNSPRAY MLO 5 GL PAIL $18.79/gl $93.95/pail 5 GL PAIL NO BID NO BID 5 GL PAIL 5 GL PAIL No bid 5 GL PAIL See item 5 above See item 5 above
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26 ULV OIL (55 GL DRUM) 55 GL DRUM $19.25/gl $1,058.75/drum 
BVA13 55 GL DRUM $26.99 $1,484.45 55 GL DRUM $653.32 $3,266.60 55 GL DRUM No bid 55 GL DRUM $852.50/drum $852.50 / 55 gal drum

27 ULV OIL (275 GL TOTE) 275 GL TOTE $19.05/gl $5,238.75/tote BVA13 275 GL TOTE $30.33 $8,340.75 275 GL TOTE $3,201.00 $16,005.00 275 GL TOTE No bid 275 GL TOTE $3,740.00/tote $3,740.00 / 275 gal tote

28 VECTOBAC 12AS (2X2.5 GL CASE) 5 2X2.5 GL CASE $38.75/gl $193.75/case 5 2X2.5 GL CASE NO BID NO BID 5 2X2.5 GL CASE 5 2X2.5 GL CASE No bid 5 2X2.5 GL CASE See alternate 
brands See alternate brands

29 VECTOBAC 12AS (30 GL DRUM) 30 GL DRUM $38.75/gl $1,162.50/drum 30 GL DRUM NO BID NO BID 30 GL DRUM 30 GL DRUM No bid 30 GL DRUM See alternate 
brands See alternate brands

30 VECTOBAC WDG GRANULAR 24 LB BAG $67.04/lb $1,608.96/24x1lb case 24 LB BAG NO BID NO BID 24 LB BAG 24 LB BAG No bid 24 LB BAG See alternate 
brands See alternate brands

31 VECTOPRIME FG 40 LB BAG $4.37/lb $174.80/bag 40 LB BAG NO BID NO BID 40 LB BAG 40 LB BAG No bid 40 LB BAG NO BID NO BID

32 VECTOMAX FG 40 LB BAG $10.08/lb $403.20/bag 40 LB BAG NO BID NO BID 40 LB BAG 40 LB BAG No bid 40 LB BAG NO BID NO BID

33 VECTOLEX FG 40 LB BAG $6.98/lb $279.20/bag 40 LB BAG NO BID NO BID 40 LB BAG 40 LB BAG No bid 40 LB BAG NO BID NO BID

1 AQUABEC
{Enter Alternate Product}

{Enter Manufacturer}
2 DELTAGUARD

{Enter Alternate Product}
{Enter Manufacturer}

3 FOURSTAR
{Enter Alternate Product}

{Enter Manufacturer}
4 FYFANON ULV

{Enter Alternate Product}
{Enter Manufacturer}

5 NATULAR
{Enter Alternate Product}

{Enter Manufacturer}

ALTERNATIVE PRODUCTS

23-760 MOSQUITO CONTROL INSECTICIDE CHEMICALS - BID TABULATION

ADAPCO, LLC CLARK MOSQ CNTRL PRODUCTS VESERIS NUTRIEN AG SOLUTIONS TARGET

2x2.5 GL CASE OR 
30 GL DRUM $36.50 / Gallon $36.50 / Gallon

N/A N/A N/A

N/A N/AN/A

N/A N/A N/A

N/A

2.5 gal jug $1,319.25 $3,298.13

N/A N/A
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6 PERMANONE
PermaSease 30-30

ADAPCO/CSI
7 ULV OIL

{Enter Alternate Product}
{Enter Manufacturer}

8 VECTOBAC
{Enter Alternate Product}

{Enter Manufacturer}
9 ADDITIONAL PRODUCT

PermaSease 30-30
ADAPCO/CSI

10 ADDITIONAL PRODUCT
Altosid XR - Metalarv XRP

Valent BioSciences 

N/A N/A N/A275 GL TOTE $24,585.00 $122,925.002X2.5 GL CASE $91.49/gl $457.25/case 30 gal drum/275 gal 
tote

$168.05/$168.0
7 $5,041.50/$46,219.25

N/A N/A

55 LB Drum $1,735.80

N/A

25 lb drum $750.00 / Drum $750.00 / 25 lb Drum

$36.50 / Gallon

30 gl drum $91.29/gl $2,738.70 case (220 tablets) $5.50 $1,210.00 40 LB BAG $390.80 $1,954.00

$8,679.00 2x2.5 GL CASE OR 
30 GL DRUM $36.50 / Gallon

200 WSP per case $2.45/WSP $490.00/case 40 lb bag (must order 
35 bags) $3.87 $154.80

Quart $42.00 $42.00

N/A N/A N/A40 LB BAG $140.80 $704.00 Gallon $148.00 $37,000.00
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