BID TABULATION 23-724 SAFETY SUPPLIES
Agni Enterprises, LLC
dba Head to Heels Henry Schein, Inc. Life Assist, Inc.
BID TABULATION Safety Supplies
GRgUP FIRST AID - NON PHARMACUTICALS UNIT PRICE PER UNIT | PRICE PER UNIT PRIUC;JI;’ER
1 Alcohol, Rubbing Pint size bottles - 12 bottles/case cs $71.33 $18.12 $19.50
2 Alcohol Pads, Cleaning 100/Box BX $2.34 $0.62 $1.78
3 Ammonia Inhalant, 10/bx BX $1.61 $2.50 $2.35
4 Antiseptic cleaning pad, 100 bx BX $2.34 $3.85 $4.00
5 Bandage, Stretch 2"x5" yards, 1/roll ROLL $1.40 $0.17 $0.20
6 Bandage, Butterfly, 10/PK PK $0.84 $2.99 $1.45
7 Bandage, Compress 3"x3" 10/SLV SLV $63.50 No Bid $21.95
8 Band-Aid 1"x3", 16/PK PK $0.70 $0.75 $1.50
9 Band-Aid 3/4"x3" 100/bx BX $4.10 $1.05 $1.30
10 Betadine Swab, 10/Pk PK $1.63 $1.35 $0.12
11 Burn Ointment, 6/Pk PK $1.31 $2.13 $7.95
12 Burn Spray, Aerosol, 30z EA $26.15 No Bid $3.25
13 Cold Pack Jr., 5/Pk PK $14.03 $3.45 $0.36
14 Eye Wash Solution, 1 oz, 5/pk PK $38.10 $10.75 $2.20
15 First Aid Kit / Complete / 24 units KIT $90.90 $47.03 $28.00
16 Gloves, Latex powderless Med, Lg, XL BOX $6.89 $5.00 $11.50
17 Particulate Respirator, N-95, 10/bx BX $29.76 $8.60 $18.50
18 Peroxide, 160z, plastic btl, 12/cs Ccs $57.60 $6.72 $8.40
19 Sting Relief wipes, 9/Pk PK $0.69 $1.51 $8.60
20 Sunscreen SPF 30+, 100 pouches/Disp 50 per Box BOX $41.20 $44.14 $10.95
GROUP A TOTAL $456.42 $160.73 $153.86
GRgUP PUBLIC SAFETY UNIT PRICE PER UNIT | PRICE PER UNIT PRIUCl\lfliER
1 Barricade, Plastic, Type 11, Engineering grade EA $101.94 No Bid NOBID
2 Barricade, Plastic, Type 11, High Intensity grade EA $124.74 No Bid NOBID
3 Batteries, 6 volt, Barricade light EA $37.19 No Bid NOBID
4 Chainsaw Prochaps 90 Series - 33" long EA $108.12 No Bid NOBID
5 Chainsaw Prochaps 90 Series - 36" long EA $140.52 No Bid NOBID
6 Cooler, 10 gal, yellow igloo EA $125.87 No Bid NOBID
7 Cooler, 5 gal, yellow igloo EA $86.34 No Bid NOBID
8 Cooler, 3 gal, yellow igloo EA $80.39 No Bid NOBID
9 Cooler, 2 gal, yellow igloo EA $76.02 No Bid NOBID
10 Coverall, White, zipper front, S-L EA $4.05 No Bid NOBID
11 Coverall, White, zipper front, XL-1XL EA $3.84 No Bid NOBID
12 Coverall, White, zipper front, 2XL-3XL EA $4.20 No Bid NOBID
13 Ear Muff, Howard Leight LH777 or equal 24/cs cs No Bid NOBID
14 Ear Plug, disposable 200/bx BX $21.91 No Bid NOBID
15 Flag, Reflector 18' x 18" Orange Mesh EA $26.64 No Bid NOBID
16 Flag, Reflector 24' x 24" Orange Mesh EA $28.80 No Bid NOBID
17 Flashlight, 2D, 3LED, with batteries EA $36.00 No Bid NOBID
18 Gloves, ACID PROFF, Neoprene Best 12/BX BX $4.60 No Bid NOBID
19 Gloves, BEST #960 Yellow, SMALL, 12/pk PK $28.80 No Bid NOBID
20 Gloves, BEST #960 Yellow, MED, 12/pk PK $37.78 No Bid NOBID
21 Gloves, BEST #960 Yellow, LARGE, 12/pk PK $75.94 No Bid NOBID
22 Gloves, Cotton painter 12/pk PK $27.26 No Bid NOBID
23 Gloves, ladies leather palm work glove EA No Bid NOBID
24 Gloves, leather palm work glove EA $3.45 No Bid NOBID
25 Hard Hat with ratchet suspension cs $179.57 No Bid NOBID
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26 Helmet, yellow, wide brim, 12/cs Cs $167.04 No Bid NOBID
27 Knee Pads, economy, 12/cs Cs $150.84 No Bid NOBID
28 Lock Out / Tag Out Kit - Electrical EA $63.47 No Bid NOBID
29 Lock Out / Adjustable cable EA $44.12 No Bid NOBID
30 Paint, Location Marking, Pink, 12/cans/bx BS $87.74 No Bid NOBID
31 Paint, Location Marking, Orange, 12/cans/bx BS $101.28 No Bid NOBID
32 Signs, 24" Diameter, 84" pole, Stop/Slow Signs EA $51.17 No Bid NOBID
Signs, 48" temporary orange mesh, Ribs included, ONE .
33 LANE ROAD AHEAD EA $94.74 No Bid NOBID
Signs, 48" temporary orange mesh, Ribs included, ROAD .
34 WORK AHEAD EA $94.74 No Bid NOBID
Signs, 48" temporary orange mesh, Ribs included, BE .
35 PREPARED TO STOP EA $94.74 No Bid NOBID
6 Signs, 48" temporary orange mesh, Ribs included, EA $94.74 No Bid NOBID
Flagman symbol
37 Signs, orange tripod stand EA $97.28 No Bid NOBID
38 Tape, Marking, Orange, 12/rls/bx BX $70.86 No Bid NOBID
39 Tape, Marking, Pink, 12/rls/bx BS $49.32 No Bid NOBID
40 Poncho, yellow, 1 size fits all, EA $20.39 No Bid NOBID
41 Raincoat, yellow, S - L EA $29.60 No Bid NOBID
42 Raincoat, yellow, XL - 1XL EA $29.60 No Bid NOBID
43 Raincoat, yellow, 2XL-3XL EA $31.62 No Bid NOBID
44 Traffic Cone, 36" w/RFL Collars, black base W/Stencil EA $62.34 No Bid NOBID
45  |Vest/ yellow mesh w/chevron, ANSIII, M-L EA $36.60 No Bid NOBID
46 Vest / yellow mesh w/chevron, ANSI II, XL - 1XL EA No Bid NOBID
47 Vest / yellow mesh w/chevron, ANSI II, 2XL - 3XL EA $28.69 No Bid NOBID
. . NOBID
48 Visor Clear .040" 8"x15 1/2" Flag PETG universal hole EA $20.30 No Bid
GROUP B TOTAL $2,885.19 $0.00 $0.00
TOTAL GROUPS A & B TOTAL $3,341.61 $160.73 $153.86




